
Dead Execs Don't Get Bonuses: Executive
Compensation and the Corporate Culture of
Greed
In the wake of the recent financial crisis, there has been a lot of public
outcry over the excessive compensation packages awarded to top
executives. Many people believe that these bonuses are undeserved,
especially when companies are struggling to make ends meet. In some
cases, executives have even been awarded bonuses after their companies
have filed for bankruptcy.

The issue of executive compensation is a complex one. There are many
factors to consider, such as the size and profitability of the company, the
executive's experience and performance, and the company's overall
compensation structure. However, it is clear that the current system of
executive compensation is broken. Bonuses have become so large that
they are no longer tied to performance. Instead, they are seen as a way to
reward executives for simply being in the right place at the right time.
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The corporate culture of greed has created a situation where executives
are paid exorbitant salaries and bonuses, while the rest of the workforce
struggles to make ends meet. This is not only unfair, but it is also
unsustainable. If we want to create a more just and equitable society, we
need to address the issue of executive compensation.

The Problem with Executive Compensation

There are a number of problems with the current system of executive
compensation. First, bonuses are often not tied to performance. This
means that executives can be rewarded for simply being in the right place
at the right time. For example, a CEO may receive a large bonus for
overseeing a period of strong growth, even if that growth was due to factors
beyond the CEO's control, such as a favorable economic climate.

Second, bonuses are often too large. In some cases, executives have been
awarded bonuses that are larger than their base salaries. This is simply
unacceptable. Bonuses should be a reward for exceptional performance,
not a way to inflate executive pay.

Third, bonuses are often paid in cash. This means that executives can walk
away with their bonuses even if the company they worked for goes
bankrupt. This is a major problem, as it allows executives to profit from their
own failures.

The Corporate Culture of Greed
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The corporate culture of greed has played a major role in the excessive
compensation of executives. In recent years, there has been a growing
trend towards shareholder primacy. This is the belief that the primary goal
of a corporation is to maximize shareholder value. As a result, executives
have increasingly been pressured to deliver short-term results, even if
those results come at the expense of long-term sustainability.

The corporate culture of greed has also led to a decline in ethical behavior.
Executives are often willing to do whatever it takes to increase their own
compensation, even if it means breaking the law or harming the company.
For example, some executives have been known to manipulate financial
statements in order to boost their bonuses.

Solutions to the Problem

There are a number of things that can be done to address the problem of
excessive executive compensation. First, we need to tie bonuses to
performance. This means that executives should only receive bonuses if
they meet certain pre-determined goals. These goals should be
challenging, but achievable. They should also be aligned with the long-term
interests of the company.

Second, we need to reduce the size of bonuses.Bonuses should be a
reward for exceptional performance, not a way to inflate executive pay. A
good rule of thumb is that bonuses should not exceed 50% of an
executive's base salary.

Third, we need to pay bonuses in stock. This will align the interests of
executives with the interests of shareholders. When executives are paid in



stock, they are more likely to make decisions that are in the best interests
of the company over the long term.

Finally, we need to change the corporate culture of greed. We need to
move away from the shareholder primacy model and towards a model that
emphasizes stakeholder capitalism. This means that corporations should
consider the interests of all stakeholders, including employees, customers,
and the community.

The issue of executive compensation is a complex one. There are many
factors to consider, such as the size and profitability of the company, the
executive's experience and performance, and the company's overall
compensation structure. However, it is clear that the current system of
executive compensation is broken. Bonuses have become so large that
they are no longer tied to performance. Instead, they are seen as a way to
reward executives for simply being in the right place at the right time.

The corporate culture of greed has created a situation where executives
are paid exorbitant salaries and bonuses, while the rest of the workforce
struggles to make ends meet. This is not only unfair, but it is also
unsustainable. If we want to create a more just and equitable society, we
need to address the issue of executive compensation.
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